

Purchasing Department

BID AWARD

Custodial Supplies

2022-23-C08

Term: April 13, 2023 - March 31, 2024

SOUTHERN WESTCHESTER

BOARD OF COOPERATIVE EDUCATIONAL SERVICES

17 BERKLEY DRIVE

RYE BROOK, NY 10573

GC41	PK	Scrubbing Pads, 6x9, 3M #96, 12 per pack	VB96MSP	Imperial	\$4.89
GC42	PK	Scrubbing Pads, 4-5/8x10, White, 3M "Doodlebug" 5 per pack, 3M # 8440	26690634	Aramsco/ EA Morse	\$4.25
GC43	вх	Scrubbing Pads, 4-5/8x10, Brown, 3M "Doodlebug" 5 per pack, 3M # 8541	Pads, 4-5/8x10, Brown, 3M "Doodlebug" 5 per pack, 3M # 631BRN		\$3,95
GC44	EA	Scrubbing pad holders, swivel action, threaded socket, accepts 15/16" IMP2000 IMP2000		WB Mason	\$5.86
GC45	CS	Sponges, Scrubbing, Medium Duty, 3.5" x 6-1/8", yellow/green, 40 per case, 3M #74N or equal BB74MSS		Imperial	\$12.10
GC46	cs	Sponges, removal, chemical free, for use with water only,, made of 3 layers, for crayon, pencil pen mark removal, removes scuff marks, stains 30 sponges per case		Ocean Janitorial	\$14.49
GC47	EA	Squeege Handle, Brass, Handle only Ettore 1324	1324SQU	Imperial	\$6,29
GC48	EA	Squeege Handle, Stainless, Handle only Ettore 1343	Е'Г1343	Sterling Sanitary	\$9.68
GC49	So	aps and Cleaners (See Also GREEN Section)			_
GC50	CS	Bleach, Liquid, 5.25%, 32 0z., 12/Case	QTBL	Imperial	\$19,90
GC51	CS	Bleach, Liquid, 5.25%, Gallon, (6/cs)	VBBLCH6	Imperial	\$16.39
GC52	CS	Cleaner, Whiteboard, no film, reduces glare, for white boards, 8 oz. Pump bottle, 12 per case. Sanford #81803	SAN81803	WB Mason	\$32 .34
GC53	CS	Cleaner, toilet bowl disinfectant, 9.5% hydrochloric acid, effective on rust, uric acid and hard water deposits. Clings to the surface for easier cleaning. Ready to use formula. Packed quarts, 12 per case. Diversey "Crew" #004578	NCL172045	WB Mason	\$18.53
GC54	cs	Cleaner, toilet bowl disinfectant,mild, non-acid, cleans, disinfects, deodorizes, effective against AIDS and hepititis B viruses, floral scent, I quart, 12 Qts. Per case, RTU, Spartan #7116	NABC	Imperial	\$23.00
GC55	CS	Cleaner, Non Acid Bathroom Disinfectant, 3M #15A, 4x1/2 gal	NCL172029	WB Mason	\$21,70
GC56	CS	Cleaner, Bowl, "Easy Packs" by Drackett. Enzyme detergent attacks organic waste without hard acids or caustics. Premeasured 1/2 oz. Packets dissolve completely in water. 90 packs per tub, 2 tubs per case.	26251746	Aramsco/ EA Morse	\$45,41
GC57	EA	Cleaner, General Purpose, 5 Gallon Envirobox, JDIV 904516	NCL090121	WB Mason	\$22.22
GC58	cs	Cleanser, Powdered, 21 oz. "Comet", 24 per case	SCOUR	Imperial	\$31.52
GC59	cs	Cleaner, RTU Spray bottle w/12 sprayers, eliminates grease, petroleum, and food soils, red color, rine scent, 32 oz. bottle, 12 per case, Diversey Spitfire # 95891789	16638645	Aramsco/ EA Morse	\$35.64
GC60	CS	Cleaner, Speedball 2000, RTD #22, non butyl, heavy duty, low odor citrus scent, purple in color, 1.5 liter, 2 per case #95892175	DVO95891164	WB Mason	\$63.68

GC61	cs	Disinfectant, Diversey Oxivir Ready to use General Virucide, Bactericide, Tuberculocide, fungicide, sanitizer. One step, ready to dispense formulated with proprietary hydrogen peroxide technology. Non corrosive. 12 - 32 oz per case. Diversey #4277285	CARPE32	Imperial	\$56.66
GC62	EA	Disinfectant, heavy duty quartanery disinfectant, cleaner, sanitzier and deodorizer. 1.25 L/4per case, Buckeye E22, 6022-1400.		Ocean Janitorial	\$186,68
GC63	cs	Disinfectant, Neutral, Concentrated, Spearmint, Dark Pink, 4 GAL/Cas US Chemical 057130	NCL23729	WB Mason	\$25.47
GC64	cs	Glass cleaner, 32 oz, 12/case, w/pump spray head, ammoniated. Windex #90139	NCL130336	WB Mason	\$23.33
GC65	CS	Graffiti remover, aerosol, removes magic markers, pen, ink, crayon, 16-17 oz. can, 12 per case	SPARTAN 3171	Imperial	\$91.56
GC66	CS	Sanitizer, Hand, 1000 ml, Clear Foam, Kimcare, 6 per case, Kimberly Clark 91560	KCC91560	WB Mason	\$79.99
GC67	CS	Sanitizer, Hand, Ecolab Nexa, ECOL 6100781, 2 x 1250 ml per cs	6102064	Imperial	\$ 46.67
GC68	CS	SANITIZER, CONCENTRATED, WATERLESS HAND SANITIZER 2 X 1.3 Liter per case, ECOL6100873	6100874	Imperial	\$303.66
GC69	CS	Sanitizer, Hand, Foam, non-alcohol, 6 liter per case	NCL044557	WB Mason	\$34.88
GC70	CS	Sanitizer, Inopak 5025-L1000, Dermagel Waterless Hand Sanitizer, 1000 ml, 8 per case			NO AWARD
GC71	CS	Sanitizer, Hand, PURELL, Clear, Foam, 1200 ml refill, 2 per case, GoJo Purell # 539202		WB Mason	\$ 61.02
GC72	CS	DEB/SBS #CLRILG Mild foam soap, dye and perfume free, clear, 6/1 liter per case	SCJCLR1LG	Sterling Sanitary	\$36,64
GC73	CS	DEB/SBS #55856 Instant foam free, alcohol/dye free, bio-degradable hand sanitizer 6x1 liter/case	SCJ55857	Sterling Sanitary	\$ 39.65
GC74	CS	DEB/SBS AeroGreen Antibacterial Foam soap, #57256, 1 liter, 8 per case	ANTIL	Imperial	\$ 47.00
GC75	CS	Soap, Hand Foam Antibacterial, Ecolab NEXA, ECOL6100721, 2 x 1250 ml per case	6101091	Imperial	\$ 41.99
GC76	cs	Soap, Hand, Foaming, Standard NEXA, ecol 6100710 2 X 1250 ML PER CASE	6100710	Imperial	\$31.68
GC77	CS	Soap, Hand, Concentrated foaming antibacterial hand soap, 2 x 1.3 Liter per case ECOL 6100781	6100872	lmperial	\$124.44
GC78	cs	Soap, foam, clear, 1000 ml, 6 per case Kimberly 91554	KCC91554	WB Mason	\$51.41
GC79	cs	Soap/Sanitizer, White, 1000 ml, 6 per case, Kimberly Clark	91560	Imperial	\$87.30
GC80	CS	Soap, Lotion skin Cleanser, 1000 ml, pink, 6 per case, Kimberly Clark# 91556	KCC91556	WB Mason	\$35.95
GC81	cs	Soap, Pink, Foam, 1200 ml, 2 per case, Kimberly 91592	91592	Imperial	\$35.89
GC82	cs	Soap, White Luxury Foam, 1 liter, citrus floral, pink, 6 per case, Kimberly 91552	91552	lmperial	\$45.62

CC93	Cs	Sanitizer, Buckeye Symmetry, , non alcohol 1250 ml, 6 per case, #9015-	NCL044557	WB Mason	635.00
GC83 GC84	CS CS	Soft Scrub Cleaner by Clorox, mild abrasive, gel, 17 oz. bottle, 9 per	DIA15020CT	WB Mason	\$35.87 \$35.36
GC85	CS	Stainless Steel Cleaner, Aerosol, 14 oz., 12 per case, 3M #14002	NCL2006	WB Mason	\$43.36
GC86	CS	Wipes, Purell, Sanitizing Hand Wipes, canister of 70, 6 per case Purell #911306	GOJ911306CT	WB Mason	\$52.59
GC87	CS	Wipes, Disinfecting, 75 per tub, 6 tubs per case, Clorox # 15949 or equal	192804	Imperial	\$25,95
GC88	CS	Wipes, TB Disinfectant, ready to use in pop up container, based on hydrogen peroxide, 160 count, 12 per case. Diversey Oxivir #4599516	OC4599516	Imperial	\$ 131,34
GC89	вх	Wipes, "Wypall" wipers, blue, 12.5" x 16.8", in "BRAG" Box, 160 wipe per box Kimberly 41041	KCC41041	WB Mason	\$28.51
GC90	EA	Clorox Total 360 Electrostatic Sprayer	16458364	Aramsco/ EA Morse	\$3,199.00
GC91	EA	Clorox Total 360 Disinfectant Cleaner (To be used with Clorox Total 360 Electrostatic Sprayer) Size: 1 Gallon	CLO31650	WB Mason	\$19.69
GC92	EA	Clorox Anywhere Hard Surface Sanitizing Spray (To be used with Clorox Total 360 Electrostatic Sprayer) Size: 1 Gallon	CLO31651	WB Mason	\$19.69
		Floor Care Products			
	Additional	Floor Care Products are listed under "Dilution Systems" & "Green" Products			
GC93	CS	Carpet Pre-Spotter, Quart, Ready to Use, Spartan 3035RTU, 12 Qt per Case	NCL62236	WB Mason	\$27.87
GC94	cs	Carpet Stain Remover, aerosol, for all types of stains, 12 - 20 oz. Cans per case	26301061	Aramsco/ EA Morse	\$57.96
GC95	GAL	Carpet Defoamer, For Extraction machines. Russall #R811G. Enter a price per gallon	NCL66029	WB Mason	\$8.01
GC96	cs	Floor Finish, 25% solids, non-buff metal interlock requires fewer coats, may be spray buffed. Ph is 9.1, 4 gallon/case, Spartan "On and On" # 407304	26371260	Aramsco/ EA Morse	\$17.41
GC97	5 GAL	Floor Finish, 25% solids, non-buff metal interlock requires fewer coats, may be spray buffed. Ph is 9.1, 5 gallon pail, Spartan "On and On" # 407305	NCL51021	WB Mason	\$68.40
	FR	ESHENERS & DEODORIZERS			
GC98	CS	Carpet Fresheners, Arm & Hammer "Country Garden" Deodorizer, 12 - 15 oz. "Shaker" canisters per case	SHAKE15	Imperial	\$35.12
GC99	DZ	Urinal Blocks, 3 oz. 12/BX, assorted deodorizing scents	FRS12TOSSCH	WB Mason	\$9.12
GC100	DZ	Screens, Urinal, Non-Para, w/enzyme block to clean and deodorize, scented (berry or pine), last ups to 30 days.	FVSRC	Imperial	\$8.62
GC101	CS	Deodorizer Concentrate, Fresh Scent, 3M #13A, 4x1/2 gal		Ocean Janitorial	\$430.46
GC102	CS	Screens, Urinal, herbal scented, wavey, 10 per pack, 6 packs per case - bid PER CASE	FVSRC	Imperial	\$69.95

Southern Westchester BOCES 17 Berkley Dr. Rye Brook, NY 10573

Custodial Supplies Bid #2022-23-C08

GC195	EA	Wastebasket, Medium, 28 Quart, 14-3/8x10-1/4x15, Contico #2927 or Rubbermaid # 2956 or equal	RCPFG295600BEIG	WB Mason	\$5.65
GC196	EA	Wastebasket, Small, 14 Quart, 11-3/8x8-1/4x12-1/8, Contico #2914 or Rubbermaid # 2955 equal (Specify color when ordering, beige or black)	RCPFG295500BEIG	WB Mason	\$4.46
GC197	EA	Waste Receptacle, Rubbermaid "Brute", 32 gallon, 22 x 27.25, Available in Black, Beige Brown or Grey/ Rubbermaid # 2632		Ocean Janitorial	\$16.74

Term: April 13, 2023 - March 31, 2024

FLOOR CARE PRODUCTS

See Dilution Control Section and Green Products Section for additional products

	Manufacturer	Stock Number	U/M	Description	Vendor	Price
FC1	BUCKEYE	5178-5000	5 GAL	Floor Cleaner, Ready to Use (RTU) for wood floors, used to remove dirt and soil during wet screen process prior to coating application. Buckeye "Screen Clean" #5178-5000, 5 gallon	Ocean Janitorial	\$79.24
FC2	BUCKEYE	5182-5000	5 GAL	Buckeye Reflections Coliseum 350 Floor CoatingA low VOC OMU wood floor coating with exceptional durability and shine. Easy application, brilliant sh 4 to 24 hour recoat window. Coverage: 500-600 sq ft per gallon, 5182-5000	Occan Janitorial	\$236.02
FC3	BUCKEYE	5125-5000	5 GAL BX	Floor Finish, 25% high solids, suitable for high speed buffing, wet look gloss, Buckeye Castleguard #5125-5000	Ocean Janitorial	\$130.65
FC4	BUCKEYE	5112-1000	CS	Floor Finish, RPM, Mop or auto scrubber, high speed gloss finish enhanser. 4 x 1 GAL/Case #5112-1000	Ocean Janitorial	\$107.12
FC5	BUCKEYE	5105-5000	5 GAL BX	Floor Finish, Buckeye "Lucent", Urethane fortified acrylic floor finish. 5 Gallon Box, Buckeye #5105-5000	Ocean Janitorial	\$136.11
FC6	BUCKEYE	5131-5000	5 GAL BOX	Floor Finish, Buckeye Clarion #5131-5000	Ocean Janitorial	\$92.43
FC7	BUCKEYE	5110-1000	cs	Floor Finish, Buckeye RPM #5110-1000 4 Gal/CASE	Ocean Janitorial	\$107.12
FC8	BUCKEYE	5028-5000	EA	Floor Strippers, Buckeye "Juggernaut" #5028-5000, cold water solution, works on tile concrete and masonry brunished floors, one application, no butyl, 5 gallon pail	Ocean Janitorial	\$135,33
FC9	BUCKEYE	5115-5000	EA	Floor Sealer/Finish, Buckeye "Citation", 5 gallon pail, pH 8.4, self leveling, non yellowing, detergent resistant, for vinyl, terrazzo,slate, marble, concrete, 5115-5000	Ocean Janitorial	\$111.54
FC10	BUCKEYE	5025-5000	5 GAL BX	Floor Stripper, fast acting, low foaming, low odor, Buckeye Ripsaw, #5025-5000 5 Gal Box	Ocean Janitorial	\$104,20
FC11	BUCKEYE	5172-5000	5 GAL	Gym Floor Finish, 100% Urethane quick dry wood floor finish for all types of wood. 5 gallon bag in a box. Buckeye "Arena" #5172-5000	Ocean Janitorial	\$412.23
FC12	BUCKEYE	5035-1000	CS	Carpet Cleaner, Extraction, highly concentrated, cotrols Odor, Bucyeye 5035-1000 4 x 1 gal per case	Ocean Janitorial	\$76,34
FC13	BUCKEYE	5410-1000	CS	Carpet Defoamer, concentrated, for use in all machine, Buckeye 5410-1000, 4 x 1 GAL per case	Ocean Janitorial	\$74.41
FC14	DIVERSEY	4966769	CS	Baseboard/Spot Stripper, extra heavy duty, foam, clear color, lightly scented, Diversey "Bravo" #4966769. 12 - 23 oz. Aerosol cans per case	Imperial	\$72.45
FC15	DIVERSEY	903844	cs	Carpet Extraction Cleaner, JDIV #903844 4 x 1 GAL	Imperial	\$44.43

Southern Westchester BOCES 17 Berkley Drive Rye Brook, NY 10573

Custodial Supplies Bid #2022-23-C08

Term: April 13, 2023 - March 31, 2024

FC49	US CHEMICAL	965488	EA	U.S. Chemical - Genesis Strippit Stripper - Fast acting stripper that removes all types of floor finishes including metal-locks, polymers and carnauba wax and any number of layers of floor finish. Dilution 1:8 - Regular or 1:4 - Heavy Duty. Product ID: 065488 Size: 5 gallon - Package: Pail.	Sterling Sanitary	\$72.33
FC50	3M	55433	EA	3M Easy Shine Applicator Kit #55433	Imperial	\$319.99
FC51	3M	55437	EA	3M Easy Shine Tubing #55437		NO BID
FC52	3M	55439	EA	3M Easy Shine Canvas Back Pack #55439,	Ocean Janitorial	\$72.56
FC53	3M	55434	EA	3M Easy Shine Applmop , 18", #55434	Ocean Janitorial	\$12.82
FC54	3M	554402	CS	3M Easy Shine Reusable Pouch #554402, 5/CS	Ocean Janitorial	\$85.54
FC55	3M	59379	cs	Stone Floor Protector, 3M 59379, 3.875 litre per bags, 2 bags per case	Imperial	\$389.99
FC56	SAPOLIN			Wood/Gym Floor, Acrylic Urethane, Single or two component finish, non yellowoing, tintable, low odor and VOC, High Gloos, 32% solid by weight, five gallon pail, Sapolin 4th Quarter	Pollack	\$328.62
FC57	SAPOLIN			Wood Floor, Gym, VOC Compliant, gloss finish, oil modified polyurethane, Sapolin Full Court Press		NO BID
				CARPET CARE		
FC58	Chem Spec	HDS14G	CS	Prespotter, Ready to use water based carpet cleaner, for use with an extractor or rotary, formulated for hard to clean spots on upholstery or carpet prior to cleaning, I Gallon, 4 per case. Chem Spec #HDS14G PRICE PER CASE	Imperial	\$31.11
FC59	Chem Spec	LD4G	CS	Defoamer, dilution: 12 oz per 25 gallon tank capacity, consists of aqueous blend that eliminates foam in carpet extractors, I Gallon, 4 per case. Chemspec # LD4G. PRICE PER CASE	Imperial	\$42.77
FC60	Chem Spec	LF774G	CS	Shampoo extractor, Dilution: Truck mount: 32 oz per 5 gal. For portable extraction: 2 oz. Per 5 gallon. Low foaming, liquid extraction cleaner for use with hot or cold, contains anti-redeposition agents to remove dirt. Chemspec LF774G. 1 gal/4 per case PRICE PER CASE	Imperial	\$49.82

See Dilution Control Section and Green Products Section for additional products

CS		Sterling Sanitary	\$60.21
CS	carpet spotting and light duty floor cleaning. Not for use on brass, chrome or	lmperial	\$79.95
CS	Surety Glass Cleaner, non-ammoniated, for use on water washable surfaces such as chrome, stainless steel sinks, counter tops and bathroom surfaces. Blue liquid, mild fragrance, 7.0 pH, 4- 128 oz. per case #4421443	Sterling Sanitary	\$68.49
cs	Surety General Purpose Cleaner, low foaming, for general cleaning & light duty degreaser, for all surfaces and floors, clear green liquid, pine fragrance, pH of 9.8 - 10.4. 4/1 gallon per case, # 374421363	Sterling Sanitary	\$85.89
0	Enviro-Brands		
PAIL	Floor Stripper, Low Odor, non toxic and non corrosive, non butyl. Clear, colorless, water soluble, clear, colorless, pH of 9.9 - 10.9. EnviroBrands Arctic Blast # eartic5. 5 Gallon	Sterling Sanitary	\$87.47
PAIL	Floor Seal/Finish, zinc free, low odor, 8.0 - 9.0 pH, EnviroBrands, Everglades UHS Floor Finish, # eceverg5, 5 Gallon	Sterling Sanitary	\$87.03
CS	Cleaner, Oxy-h2O2, for water washable surfaces, glass, mirrors, stainless steel, ceramic tile, carpet spotting. Clear liquid, citrus fragrance, 4.0 - 5.0 pH, 4 - 3.78 liters per case, #ECH2021		NO BID
	EnvirOx		
CS	Mineral Shock, #138-12Q Bowl Cleaner. From plant derived renewable ingredients. No petroleum. Use on tile, grout, stainless steel, aluminum, copper. concrete, porcelain, brick, glass and fiberglass. 12 QT/CASE	Aramsco/ EA Morse	\$79.24
CS	Critical Care, # 13906Q Disinfectant, fungicide, Virucide. Odorless, no sticky residue. Thirty second disinfection, 24 hours residual bacteria kill. Ready to Use. 6 QT/CASE	Aramsco/ EA Morse	\$59.94
CS	H2Orange 2 Concentrate 117, # 117-04B. Cleaner, degreaser, deodorizer, sanitizer, Virucide. EPA Registered. For Light Duty and Heavy duty dilution. Cleans wit hydrogen peroxide. Low foaming. For use on any water safe surface. Four One-gallon per case	Aramsco/ EA Morse	\$144,18
	Buckeye		
5 GAL	Floor Stripper, eliminates noxious odors, strips polymer floor finishes, acrylic seals & water based urethanes/ No fragrance, solution is always used full strength 5 Gallon, Buckeye "Penetrate" #5023-5000	Ocean Janitorial	\$111.48
5 GAL	& water based urethanes/ No fragrance, solution is always used full strength 5		\$111.48
5 GAL	& water based urethanes/ No fragrance, solution is always used full strength 5 Gallon, Buckeye "Penetrate" #5023-5000		\$111.48 \$96.15
	CS CS CS PAIL PAIL CS CS	fixtures, tiles, shower doors and washable surfaces. Clear, teal liquid, herbal fragrance, pH of 3.6 - 3.9. 1 Gallon per case, #4421216 All-In-One H2O2 Cleaner, a multi surface washroom cleaner w/hydrogen peroxide for use on most water washable surface: glass, mirrors, stainless steel, ceramic tile, carpet spotting and light duty floor cleaning. Not for use on brass, chrome or marble. Clear liquid, Citrus fragrance, pH of 1.0. #4504417. 4 one gallon per case Surety Glass Cleaner, non-ammoniated, for use on water washable surfaces such as chrome, stainless steel sinks, counter tops and bathroom surfaces. Blue liquid, mild fragrance, 7.0 pH, 4-128 oz. per case #4421443 Surety General Purpose Cleaner, low foaming, for general cleaning & light duty degreaser, for all surfaces and floors, clear green liquid, pine fragrance, pH of 9.8-10.4. 4/1 gallon per case, # 374421363 Enviro-Brands Floor Stripper, Low Odor, non toxic and non corrosive, non butyl. Clear, colorless, water soluble, clear, colorless, pH of 9.9 - 10.9. EnviroBrands Arctic Blast # earties. 5 Gallon Floor Seal/Finish, zinc free, low odor, 8.0 - 9.0 pH, EnviroBrands, Everglades UHS Floor Finish, # eceverg5, 5 Gallon Cleaner, Oxy-h2O2, for water washable surfaces, glass, mirrors, stainless steel, ceramic tile, carpet spotting. Clear liquid, citrus fragrance, 4.0 - 5.0 pH, 4 - 3.78 liters per case, #ECH2O21 EnvirOx Mineral Shock, #138-12Q Bowl Cleaner. From plant derived renewable ingredients. No petroleum. Use on tile, grout, stainless steel, aluminum, copper. concrete, porcelain, brick, glass and fiberglass. 12 QT/CASE Critical Care, # 13906Q Disinfectant, fungicide, Virucide. Odorless, no sticky residue. Thirty second disinfection, 24 hours residual bacteria kill. Ready to Use, 6 QT/CASE H2Orange 2 Concentrate 117, # 117-04B. Cleaner, degreaser, deodorizer, sanitizer, Virucide. EPA Registered. For Light Duty and Heavy duty dilution. Cleans with hydrogen peroxide. Low foaming. For use on any water safe surface. Four One-gallon per case	fixtures, tiles, shower doors and washable surfaces. Clear, teal liquid, herbal fragrance, pH of 3.6 - 3.9. 1 Gallon per case. # 4421216 All-in-One H2O2 Cleaner, a multi surface washroom cleaner w/hydrogen peroxide for use on most water washable surface: glass, mirrors, stainless steel, ceramic tile, carpet spotting and light duty floor cleaning. Not for use on brass, chrome or marble. Clear liquid, Citrus fragrance, pH of 1.0. #4504417. 4 one gallon per case Surety Glass Cleaner, non-ammoniated, for use on water washable surfaces such as chrome, stainless steel sinks, counter tops and bathroom surfaces. Blue liquid, mild fragrance, 7.0 pH, 4-128 oz. per case #4421443 Surety General Purpose Cleaner, low foaming, for general cleaning & light duty degreaser, for all surfaces and floors, clear green liquid, pine fragrance, pH of 9.8 - 10.4. 4/1 gallon per case, # 374421363 Enviro-Brands Floor Stripper, Low Odor, non toxic and non corrosive, non butyl. Clear, colorless, water soluble, clear, colorless, pH of 9.9 - 10.9. EnviroBrands Arctic Blast # eartic5. 5 Gallon PAIL Floor Seal/Finish, zine free, low odor, 8.0 - 9.0 pH, EnviroBrands, Everglades UHS Floor Finish, # eceverg5, 5 Gallon Sterling Sanitary Sterling Sanitary Sterling Sanitary EnvirOx EnvirOx Mineral Shock, #138-12Q Bowl Cleaner. From plant derived renewable ingredients. No petroleum. Use on tile, grout, stainless steel, aluminum, copper. concrete, porcelain, brick, glass and fiberglass. 12 QT/CASE Critical Care, # 13906Q Disinfectant, fungicide, Virucide. Odorless, no sticky residue. Thirty second disinfection, 24 hours residual bacteria kill. Ready to Use. Aramsco/ EA Morse CS 6 QT/CASE H2Orange 2 Concentrate 117, # 117-04B. Cleaner, degreaser, deodorizer, sanitizer, Virucide. EPA Registered. For Light Duty and Heavy duty dilution. Cleans wit hydrogen peroxide. Low foaming. For use on any water safe surface. Four One-gallon per case

			<u></u>	
GP28	CS	Buckeye Eco All Purpose Cleaner, Four 1.25 Litre (I) per case #6011-1400	Ocean Janitorial	. \$122,20
GP29	CS	Buckeye Eco Muscle Cleaner, Four 1.25 l per case, #6014-1400	Ocean Janitorial	\$91.73
GP30	CS	Buckeye Eco Neutral Disinfectant, four 1.25 l per case, (not Green Seal) #6023- 1400	Ocean Janitorial	\$85.18
GP31	cs	Buckeye Eco Neutral Cleaner, Four 1.25 l per case, #6031-1400	Ocean Janitorial	\$80.65
GP32	CS	Buckeye Eco Floor Cleaner, Four 1.25 per acse #6032-1400	Ocean Janitorial	\$109,82
GP33	CS	Buckeye Eco Glass Cleaner, Four 1.25 l per acse, #6012-1400	Ocean Janitorial	\$85.28
GP34	CS	Buckeye Eco Odor Eliminator, Four 1.25 I per acse, #6041-1400	Ocean Janitorial	\$102,49
Ju sea		US Chemical		
GP35	CS	Floor Cleaner, general cleaning floors & walls, balanced pH, for all floor finishes, use with spray bottle, mop and pail, cloths, low foam, no phosphorus, teal blue, floral scent, U.S> Chemical "Surety" Neutral Cleaner, #5491697, 4/64 oz. per case, Green Seal Certified	Sterling Sanitary	\$104.46
GP36	CS	Neutral Floor Cleaner, 4/1 Gallons per case, Surety #422024	Sterling Sanitary	\$66.25
GP37	CS	Surety All Purpose Cleaner, Citrus scent, dark orange, low foam, for spray bottle, mop and cloth, no phosphorus, Diversey Surety #5492235, 4/64 oz per case, Green seal	Sterling Sanitary	\$102,51
GP38	CS	Surety Hydrogen Peroxide Cleaner, H202, Green Seal, floral scent,. Low foam, 4 - 64 oz per case, #5491574	Sterling Sanitary	\$116.62
GP39	CS	Surety Hydrogen Peroxide Cleaner, H202, Green Seal, floral scent, Low foam,4x1gal per case oz per case, #4504417	Sterling Sanitary	\$116.75
-50		3M		
GP40	EA	Glass Cleaner Concentrate Non Streaking for windows glass and mirrors. 30 gallon yield per 2 liter bottle. 3M 1L, 2 liter, grey cap	Ocean Janitorial	\$52.83
GP41	CS	Neutral Cleaner, Concentrate No Rinse, .5 gallon, four per case, 3M 3A	Ocean Janiterial	\$126.03
GP42	EA	Neutral Cleaner Concentrate, no rinse, low foam, for mop or auto scrubber, 207 gallon yield per 2 liter. #3H, Grey cap	Ocean Janitorial	\$51,17
GP43	CS	Food Service Degreaser Concentrate, #7A, 4 x 1/2 gal	Ocean Janitorial	\$389.77
GP44	CS	General Purpose Concentrate - All purpose cleaner for use on floors, walls and non-pourous surfaces. 35 gallon yield per 2 liter. #8L, grey cap	Ocean Janitorial	\$158,18
GP45	CS	General Purpose Cocentrate, all purpose cleaner for use on floors, walls and non-pourous surfaces, #8A 4 x 1/2 gallon	Ocean Janitorial	\$134.55

GP46	cs	Glass cleaner & Protector - fast drying, streak free, Scotchguard technology, . #17A, 4 x 1/2 gallon	Ocean Janitorial	\$176.02
GP47	EA	Glass cleaner & Protector - fast drying, streak free, Scotchguard technology, 42 gallon yield from 2 liter. #17L, Grey Cap	Ocean Janitorial	\$49.42
GP48	CS	Glass Cleaner & Protector, RTU, #599828, 12 - 32 oz. per case	Ocean Janitorial	\$51,74
GP49	EA	Floor Cleaner concentrate - low foam, mop or autoscrubber, 137 gallo yield from 2 liter, #24H, grey cap	Ocean Janitorial	\$64.75
GP50	EA	Peroxide Cleaner, no residue, for carpet and non porous surface, low odor, 53 gallon yield from 2 liter, #34H, (High Flow) grey cap	Ocean Janitorial	\$25.29
GP51	EA	Peroxide cleaner, no residue, for carpet and non porous surface, low odor. 53 gallon yield from 2 liter, #34L, (Low Flow) grey cap	Ocean Janitorial	\$25,29
		HAND SOAPS		
GP52	cs	DEB/SBS #AZU2LT, Refresh TM Azure FOAM, Lightly Perfumed Gentle Foam Hand Wash Refresh TM Azure FOAM is Green Seal TM certified. Product ID: AZU2LT Size: 4/2-Liter per case.	lmperial	\$36.69
GP53	cs	SCA/Tork Premium Extra Mild Foam Soap, #SCA401211, 6/1 liter per case Green Seal	WB Mason	\$55.00
GP54	CS	DEB/SBS Aero-Rose Foam Soap, #RFW1LG (57230), 1lier, 8 per case, Green Seal Certified	Sterling Sanitary	\$36.67
GP55	CS	Soap, "Clearly Green" foam soap, formaldehyde & paraben free, Green Seal Certified, 6/1000 ml per case, Inopak 5080L1000		NO BID
GP56	CS	Soap, Foam soap, fragrance and dye free, clear, 1000 ml, 6 per case, Kimberly 91565 Green Seal Certified	WB Mason	\$44.99
GP57	cs	Soap, Foaming Hand wash, biodegradable and dye free, meets Green Seal GS-41, Buckeye Symmetry # 9009-1120, 1250 ml, 6 per case	Ocean Janitorial	\$53.74
GP58	CS	Soap, concentrated hand, general use, Green Seal Ceritified, 2 x 1.3 litre per case, Ecolab #6100869	lmperial	\$242.79

Term: April 13, 2023 - March 31, 2024

General Catalog Discount This Bid is for Purchasing Supplies & Equipment Only. Service & Maintenance is NOT Covered. State a Percentage from manufacturer's list price: Vendor % Discount Affiliated Laboratories No Award Alto U.S. Inc. Imperial Bag & Paper 28.6% Amco No Award **American Cleaning Solutions** Sterling Sanitary 30.1% Ansell WB Mason 31.0% **Armstrong Ceiling Tiles** No Award Ball Trading Corp. No Award Benjamin Moore No Award Betco **Sterling Sanitary** 32.5% **Bobrick Washroom Equipment** WB Mason 36.0% Borit Ecotech Imperial Bag & Paper 30.0% Ocean Janitorial Buckeye 35.0% Carlisle No Award **CFR** No Award **Chase Products** No Award Chemspec No Award Chicopee No Award Clarke Equipment Imperial Bag & Paper 28.6% Clorox Imperial Bag & Paper 36.5% Colgate Palmolive WB Mason 31.0% Contico No Award Crown Matting (Floor) Aramsco/ EA Morse 20.0% Culicover & Shapiro No Award Dial Corp. Sterling Sanitary 25.1% DEB/SBS WB Mason 38.0% Diversev Imperial Bag & Paper 33.5%

Ecolab

Imperial Bag & Paper

20.0%

Electrolux	Imperial Bag & Paper	26.0%
Emist	Ocean Janitorial	10.0%
EnviroBrands	Sterling Sanitary	30.0%
Enviro Solutions	Aramsco/ EA Morse	15.0%
Envirox	Aramsco/ EA Morse	15.0%
Epic Industries		No Award
Essendant	WB Mason	33.0%
Essity	Sterling Sanitary	30.1%
Ettore	Sterling Sanitary	37.5%
Eureka	Imperial Bag & Paper	26.0%
Expanded Technologies	Aramsco/ EA Morse	10.0%
Fresh Products	Imperial Bag & Paper	36.5%
Gen-Eon		No Award
Georgia Pacific	WB Mason	38.0%
Global Material		No Award
GoJo	WB Mason	39.0%
Graco Equipment	Pollack Paint	6.0%
Graco Airless Accessories	Pollack Paint	6.0%
Hamburg		No Award
Hoover Vacuums & Floor Equipment		No Award
Hoover Accessories & Supplies		No Award
Hospital Specialty	WB Mason	36.0%
Hyscent		No Award
Impact Products	Sterling Sanitary	35.1%
Inopak		No Award
Kaivac	Aramsco/ EA Morse	18.0%
Kimberly -Clark	WB Mason	38.0%
Logichem		No Award
Lambskin Specialties	Sterling Sanitary	30.1%
Mercury Paint	Pollack Paint	30.0%
Minuteman Floor Machines	WB Mason	36.0%
Mercantile Development	Sterling Sanitary	30.1%
Nacecare	WB Mason	36.0%

National Chemical Labs	WB Mason	44.0%
New York Safety Equipment		No Award
NSS Enterprises		No Award
PPG Paints	Pollack Paint	70.0%
Proctor & Gamble	WB Mason	35.0%
Proline		No Award
Prolink	Aramsco/ EA Morse	15.0%
ProTeam	Imperial Bag & Paper	35.6%
Purell	Sterling Sanitary	38.1%
Reckitt Bensickser		No Award
Rochester Midland	3 0	No Award
Rubbermaid Commercial Products	Sterling Sanitary	45.1%
Safety Zone	Sterling Sanitary	35.1%
Sanitaire Vacuums & Floor Machines	Sterling Sanitary	37.0%
Sanitaire Accessories & Supplies	Sterling Sanitary	37.0%
San Jamar		No Award
Sherwin Williams Paint	Sherwin Williams	70.0%
Simoniz	Tri State	43.0%
Spartan Products	Sterling Sanitary	41.1%
Teknor Apex		No Award
Tennant	Imperial Bag & Paper	25.2%
The Safety Zone	Sterling Sanitary	35.1%
Three M (3M) Non-Commodity (Dilution Chemicals, Stone Floor Care, etc.)	Ocean Janitorial	30.0%
Three M (3M) Commodity (Floor Pads)	Sterling Sanitary	42.5%
Titan Equipment	Pollack Paint	6.0%
Titan Airless Accessories	Pollack Paint	6.0%
Tornado Equipment	Sterling Sanitary	30.1%
TuWay		No Award
Unger Enterprises	Aramsco/ EA Morse	38.5%
Unisan		No Award
United Receptacle	Sterling Sanitary	45.1%
US Chemical	Sterling Sanitary	30.1%

Southern Westchester BOCES 17 Berkley Dr. Rye Brook, NY 10573

Custodial Supplies Bid #2022-23-C08

Term: April 13, 2023 - March 31, 2024

USG Ceiling Tiles		No Award
Victoria Bay	Imperial Bag & Paper	20.0%
Victory Innovations	Imperial Bag & Paper	26.0%
Zep, Inc.		No Award

Notes/Exclusions

<u>Imperial</u>

Tennant - Floor machines 25.2%, Vacuums/sweepers/extractors 20.2%, Scrubbers 15.2%, Parts 10% min.

Alto & Clarke parts 15%

Victoria Bay 20% minimum

Ocean Janitorial

Buckeye 35% all except non chemical = 5% off

3M 30% off except twist n fill 35%, workplace safety 15% off

Sterling Sanitary

Betco - Chemicals 32.5%, Machines 15.1%

Enviro - Commodities 30%, Machines 19.9%, EOS-500 Dual Machine 2.5%